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JUDGMENT IS COMING 
 
December 9, 2022 
9:56 a.m. 
 
YAHWEH: 
 
Let’s truly see. Can you write this great work with human seeing? Tell Me, can you?  
 
SEERSGATE: 
 
I look back at the work. You are able to give me ways of wisdom and understanding that 
is above the common way. The wisdom I take in—I could tell it’s not my level. And I have 
not sat in a church under a local house since 2011. But something has happened within 
the past year or so. Before, I was at one level. But now, the realness is not in having 
experiences. Rather, Yahweh is breaking apart what is seen. Yahweh is showing me the 
motive for a person and what they say. It’s as if He has a thought and shares it with me. 
 
YAHWEH: 
 
Can you see and hear based on what other Christians move in? Or is your wisdom a new 
power way? Power is here and is also reflected in seeing and hearing pertaining to 
spiritual elements. To hear and see in this way will need a direct impartation from King 
Jesus. It isn’t for the whole Church, but rather a few will drink a powerful way of hearing 
and seeing that has a way to bring an influence to all to bring a turn in the Body as a 
way of bringing Kingdom order.  
 
Why do I need a judge/prophet/warrior right now? The judgment of the Lord is coming. 
What does the Lord’s judgment look like? Great power from unexplained ways with 
realignment. Removal of old ways, replaced with Yahweh’s plan. A stripping of titles and 
authority. A humbling of self. An honor brought forward to Yahweh.  
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No one can escape judgment. I will take a look at every church. There will be a weighing. 
I will look at what they did with King Jesus. An honoring of self will be dealt with. Rebellion 
against My written Word will be revealed. I will curse those who come against My great 
power. I will not bow to the Kingdom of Satan. I am Yahweh.  
 
There will come forward death threats against My servant as if these words come from 
her. There will not stand a way of rebellion. I will cut off those who will not bow to 
Yahweh. Great power, great consequences for irreverent actions. There will not have a 
way of sharing the stage with those who honor a Satan worker, nor will I give a time for 
demons to have microphone time.  
 
There is no one who can fool Yahweh. A grave warning comes forward.  
 
If you are filled with demons or have irreverent ways of action and will dishonor 
Yahweh/King Jesus/I AM—there will be a weighing. God Yahweh will decide whether to 
kill you for coming into a potent level of My nature without examining yourself. I will give 
out judgments just as in the old days of Elijah. I will strip away how grace brings no 
heavy action. 
 
I will pour out harsh judgments so that My Bride will bend. I will bring forward the real 
Bride and start a major harvest pushed by real miracles. The fake ways of what I smell 
will be dealt with. Be careful of what you say with your heart. Weigh and judge doctrine, 
but do not need to kill or usurp a prophet.  
 
Yahweh is preparing the world for the return of Christ. Now get ready. Repent. Repent. 
Repent. Do not be weighed moving against Yahweh.  
 


